NHS

Our Ref: 642/2021 Doncaster and Bassetlaw

June 2021 Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust

Re: Your request made under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

Under the freedom of information act | request as follows-
1)The admission numbers to Doncaster hospital for the last 5 years 1996 - 2021 ?

2016: 92663
2017: 96204
2018: 95493
2019: 96584
2020: 72894
2021 (Jan to Sep only): 60884

2) Of those who died of any causes this year, how many had received the covid 19 vaccine and how many
were unvaccinated?

We would be unable to break this down into those who had received the covid 19 vaccine and those that
were unvaccinated as this is not recorded as part of the hospital spell.

3) Of those admitted to hospital in 2021, how many have received any COVID 19 vaccine?

We are unable to provide this information as it is not recorded as part of the hospital spell.



