NHS

Our Ref: 471/2022 Doncaster and Bassetlaw

JANUARY 2022 Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust

Re: Your request made under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

Please state:

1. The total outstanding medical bills currently owed to the Trust by overseas visitors. Please provide
subtotals for each hospital within the Trust.

£1,384,082.98 — we do not record the information as per hospital site

2. The top three highest outstanding medical bills owed to the Trust by individual overseas visitors and the
nationality of those visitors. (i.e. £495,000 owed by an individual from France)

£11,831 Romania
£10,137 Slovakia
£9,600 Romania

3. Of the total amount owed to the Trust, please provide a breakdown of the nationalities of overseas
visitors who currently have outstanding medical bills (i.e. visitors from USA: £200,000 / visitors from Japan:

£130,000)

This information would take too long to provide as we do not record the information in full this
way

4. Please provide a breakdown of medical procedures that the outstanding medical bills relate to, for
example £300,000 owed for Kidney disease treatments, for the Trust as a whole.

Not providing this information in total although Maternity is the highest value

If my request exceeds time or cost limits, please advise me on how | can refine my request as per S.16 of the
FOIA.

Please send the information in a spreadsheet format, by email.



