NHS

Our Ref: 219/2023 Doncaster and Bassetlaw
MAY 2023 Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust

Re: Your request made under the Freedom of Information Act 2000

For each question, please can you provide data for the following years — 2020, 2021, 2022, 2023 to date.

1. How many sexual assaults were reported to the trust?
a) Of these allegations, please advise whether they were:

i) On Staff carried out by a staff Member

ii) On Staff carried out by a patient or visitor

iii) By Staff on a Patient

iv) By Staff on a visitor

v) On Staff carried out by a visitor

vi) On a patient carried out by a patient

b) Of these alleged offences, how many were reported to the police?

c) If these alleged offences involved members of staff or contractors of the trust, please outline whether

disciplinary proceedings took place and what was the outcome?

23 in total. Cis not recorded on Datix.

year total i i iii iv v Vi b C
2020 5 1 4 0 0 0 0 0 -
2021 8 0 5 1 0 0 2 1 -
2022 7 0 7 0 0 0 0 1 -
2023 3 0 1 0 0 0 2 1 -

2. How many rapes were reported to the trust? Datix does not record this level
of information as a searchable field.

a) Of these allegations, please advise whether they were:
i) On Staff carried out by a staff Member
ii) On Staff carried out by a patient or visitor
iii) By Staff on a Patient
iv) By Staff on a visitor
v) On Staff carried out by a visitor
vi) On a patient carried out by a patient
b) Of these alleged offences, how many were reported to the police?
c) If these alleged offences involved members of staff or contractors of the trust, please outline whether
disciplinary proceedings took place and what was the outcome?
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