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Our Ref: 189 Doncaster and Bassetlaw
Teaching Hospitals
March 2025 NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act Request

In 2005, the government brought in Maintaining High Professional Standards
[MHPS].

This allows trusts to investigate concerns against doctors.

| am looking for the following information under the Freedom of Information Act
because | cannot see it on your website or any publication.

1. How many doctors work for your trust? By the term doctor, | mean
those who treat patients, not those with a PhD, and/or who are not
clinicians. 902

2. Break these into their ethnic groups and their corresponding grades
e.g., white, black, Asian or whichever way you ethnically monitor your staff. If,
for example, positions have fewer than five doctors in their grade and
ethnicity, please use an asterisk and explain there are fewer than five.

#=lower than 5

A White - British 187
272|MQO0| Ad Hoc 29
NHS|MC41 | Associate Specialist New Contract - Closed #
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed #
NHS|MC70|Specialist Grade #
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 7
NHS|ME21|PT Med Off/Gen Dental Practitioner #
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1 24
NHS|MFO02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2 17
NHS|MN37|Specialty Registrar 6
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1 #
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2 5
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3 8

NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
NHS|MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7
NHS|MSO08|Specialty Registrar ST8/SpR8
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) 20
NHS|YMS55 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 5yrs Snr
NHS|YMS56 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 6yrs Snr
NHS|YM57 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 7-8yrs Snr
NHS|YM59| Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 10yrs Snr
NHS|YM62 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 13yrs Snr
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NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant

B White - Irish
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MSO08 | Specialty Registrar ST8/SpR8
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

C White - Any other White background
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MSO08 | Specialty Registrar ST8/SpR8
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YC73 | Locum Consultant
NHS|YMG62 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 13yrs Snr
NHS|YM66 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 17yrs Snr
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant

C3 White Unspecified
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1

CA White English
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

CF White Greek
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7

CP White Polish
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

CX White Mixed
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc

CY White Other European
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

E Mixed - White & Black African
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MS03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
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NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO5|ST6-ST8 SpR6 -SpR8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

F Mixed - White & Asian
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)

G Mixed - Any other mixed background
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MFO1|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MN37|Specialty Registrar
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

GA Mixed - Black & Asian
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021

GC Mixed - Black & White
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc

GD Mixed - Chinese & White
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7

GF Mixed - Other/Unspecified
NHS|MS02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2

H Asian or Asian British - Indian
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC41 | Associate Specialist New Contract - Closed
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC70|Specialist Grade
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MHO03 | Staff Grade Practitioner (New Contract)
NHS|MN37|Specialty Registrar
NHS|MSO01 | Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS | MS02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS | MS03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS | MS04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS | MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
NHS | MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6
NHS|MTO3 |ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
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NHS|MTO5|ST6-ST8 SpR6 -SpR8 Trust Grade #
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct) 28
NHS|YC73 | Locum Consultant
NHS|YM54 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 4yrs Snr
NHS|YMS55 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 5yrs Snr
NHS|YM56 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 6yrs Snr
NHS|YM57 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 7-8yrs Snr
NHS|YM59 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 10yrs Snr
NHS|YM61 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 12yrs Snr
NHS|YM67|Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 18yrs Snr
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) 57
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant 7

J Asian or Asian British - Pakistani 92
272|MQO0 | Ad Hoc 14
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed 7
NHS|MC70|Specialist Grade #
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 7
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1 #
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2 5
NHS|MN35|Specialty Registrar FTSTA
NHS|MN37|Specialty Registrar
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade 7
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO05|ST6-ST8 SpR6 -SpR8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) 10
NHS|YC73|Locum Consultant #
NHS|YM57 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 7-8yrs Snr
NHS|YM70| Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 21-29yrs Snr #
NHS|YM72| Consultant (post 31 Oct) 9
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant #

K Asian or Asian British - Bangladeshi 11
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC46 |Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MFO02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO08 | Specialty Registrar ST8/SpR8
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

L Asian or Asian British - Any other Asian background 20

HOHF OH OHF OH T R B

HOHF O ¥ R T R O

#* H

t+

H O H O OHF T HF O



Our Ref: 189

March 2025

272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YC73 | Locum Consultant
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

LA Asian Mixed
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade

LB Asian Punjabi
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|YM®60 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 11yrs Snr

LC Asian Kashmiri
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc

LE Asian Sri Lankan
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YC73 | Locum Consultant

LF Asian Tamil
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MFO02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5

LG Asian Sinhalese
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)

LH Asian British
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

LJ Asian Caribbean
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

LK Asian Unspecified
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MTO3 |ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
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NHS|MTO5 | ST6-ST8 SpR6 -SpR8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

M Black or Black British - Caribbean
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

N Black or Black British - African 62
272|MQO0 | Ad Hoc 9
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC70|Specialist Grade #
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 5
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1 #
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1 6
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3 8
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4 #
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade #
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) 5
NHS|YMS55 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 5yrs Snr #
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) 6
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant

P Black or Black British - Any other Black background
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade

PA Black Somali
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant

PB Black Mixed
NHS|MFO02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2

PC Black Nigerian 49
272|MQQ0 | Ad Hoc 8
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 5
NHS|MSO01 | Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1 16
NHS|MS02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2 9
NHS|MS03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3 7
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade #
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YM73|Locum Consultant

PD Black British 5
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MS03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3

PE Black Unspecified
NHS|MSO01 | Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1

R Chinese 22
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1 #
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NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
NHS|MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72 | Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM67|Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 18yrs Snr
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)

S Any Other Ethnic Group 53
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC41 | Associate Specialist New Contract - Closed
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed 5
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 7
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO04 | Specialty Registrar ST4/SpR4
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
NHS|MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6
NHS|MSO07 | Specialty Registrar ST7/SpR7
NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade 6
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|MTO05|ST6-ST8 SpR6 -SpR8 Trust Grade
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YC73|Locum Consultant
NHS|YM57 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 7-8yrs Snr
NHS|YM68 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 19yrs Snr
NHS|YM72| Consultant (post 31 Oct) 6

SC Filipino
NHS|MC46 |Specialty Doctor - Closed

SD Malaysian 7
NHS|MFO01|Foundation Doctor Year 1
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3
NHS|MSO05 | Specialty Registrar ST5/SpR5
NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct)
NHS|YM72| Consultant (post 31 Oct)

SE Other Specified 9
272|MQO0|Ad Hoc
NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MT04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade
NHS|YMS55 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 5yrs Snr
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NHS|YM56 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 6yrs Snr #
NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) #
Unspecified 10
272|MQ00| Ad Hoc 8
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021 #
Unspecified #
Z Not Stated 40
272|MQ00| Ad Hoc 9

NHS|MC46 | Specialty Doctor - Closed
NHS|MC75 | Specialty Doctor 2021
NHS|MF02 | Foundation Doctor Year 2
NHS|MSO01 |Specialty Registrar ST1 /SpR1
NHS|MSO02 | Specialty Registrar ST2/ SpR2
NHS|MSO03 | Specialty Registrar ST3/SpR3 9

H OHF B T X

NHS|MSO06 | Specialty Registrar ST6/SpR6 #

NHS|MTO03|ST1/ST2 SpR1/SpR2 Trust Grade #

NHS|MTO04|ST3-ST7 SpR3 - SpR 8 Trust Grade #

NHS|YC72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) #

NHS|YM56 | Consultant (pre 31 Oct) - 6yrs Snr #

NHS|YM72|Consultant (post 31 Oct) #

Unspecified #

Grand Total 902
3. Provide a key to explain your grading system e.g. lowest to the highest
band or vice versa.
See attached Pay scale document

4. In the following years, how many complaints did you receive about

doctors under MHPS during the following years? 1 Jan-31 Dec 2021; 1 Jan-
31 Dec 2022; 1 Jan-31 Dec 2023; 1 Jan-31 Dec 2024.

We do not log complaints with the specific theme of Maintaining High Professional
Standards (MHPS) on our system (Datix). As such, we are unable to provide figures for the
years requested.

5. Please break these down into ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or
whichever way you record your data for the corresponding years. If your
numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not log ethnicity data related to complaints within our records, and therefore, we are
unable to provide a breakdown.
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6. Of these complaints, how many resulted in your investigating them?

Please list these in the corresponding years.

As stated above, complaints specifically categorised under MHPS are not recorded in our
system.

7. Please break these down into ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or
whichever way you record your data for the corresponding years. If your
numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not record ethnicity data related to complaints.

8. Of these investigations, how many resulted in a sanction, adverse
judgement or other disciplinary action? Please be clear about what the
sanction was. Please list these in the corresponding years.

We do not log complaints under MHPS on our system, and therefore, we do not hold this
information.

9. Please break these down into ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or
whichever way you record your data for the corresponding years. If your
numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not record ethnicity data for disciplinary actions related to complaints

10.  Of all complaints how many resulted in a doctor being suspended

during the inquiry? Please list these in the corresponding years.

This information is not recorded in our system under the specified categories
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11. Please break these down into ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or
whichever way you record your data for the corresponding years. If your
numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not record ethnicity data for suspensions linked to complaints

12.  Of all the complaints how many did you refer the doctor to the GMC?
Please list these in the corresponding years.

We do not record complaint data in a way that allows us to identify how many cases were
referred to the GMC.

13. Please break these into ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or
whichever way you record your data for the corresponding years. If your
numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not record ethnicity data related to GMC referrals.

14.  During your considering complaints, what is the average length of your
investigations?

As complaints under MHPS are not logged on our system, we do not hold information
regarding investigation duration.

15. Please give the average length of your considering a complaint in
terms of ethnic groups e.g., white, black, Asian or whichever way you record
your data. If your numbers are fewer than five, then use an asterisk.

We do not record ethnicity data in relation to the length of time taken to consider complaints.

Our organisation does not routinely categorise or log complaints based on Maintaining High
Professional Standards (MHPS) or by ethnic group. As a result, we do not hold the requested
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data in our records. The information provided through our complaint management system
does not align with the specific themes requested in your FOI request.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to
request an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted
within 40 working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/

Despite the number of questions, | would be incredibly surprised if you do not have
all the information which | require in an easily retrievable format, and so this will not
impact sec 12 of the FOIA.

Because of the size of your trust, | do not accept that there is any way in which you
can use the GDPR exemption because there is no way these doctors can be
identified.

This passes the threshold of the public interest case since it is examining potential
racial bias in disciplinary procedures.

Neither does sec 36 apply. Should you think this applies, | will need to know who
your qualified person [QP] is so | can raise the matter with the information
commissioner and, if necessary, ask the first-tier tribunal (FTT) to adjudicate.

| respectfully remind you that under sec 16 of the FOIA you must help me get the
information | require.
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| have asked these questions as part of a professional organisation and in a
professional tone, and so this is not a vexatious request.

| respectfully remind you that the absence of data collection on your part is of
legitimate public interest concern.

It will raise questions about why you do not consider an equality impact assessment
on the way you deal with complaints or consider systemic, structural and institutional
unconscious or racial biases in your decision-making processes.



