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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I kindly request the following information 

regarding hospital admissions related to pothole incidents: 

1.     Number of Patients Admitted Due to Pothole-Related Injuries, categorized by: 

o   Type of Road User: 

  Cyclists 

  Motorcyclists 

  Car Drivers 

  Car Passengers 

  Pedestrians 

o   Year and Month: From January 2019 to the most recent available data. 

o   Age 

2.     Details of Injuries Sustained, if available: 

o   Nature of injuries (e.g., fractures, lacerations, concussions). 

o   Severity of injuries (e.g., minor, moderate, severe). 

o   Description of injuries. 

 
 

Following a search of our records, we can confirm that the Trust does not hold the requested 

information in a reportable format. 

Admissions data is not routinely categorised by the cause or contributing factor of the incident 

(e.g., pothole-related), nor is it broken down by specific road user types in the Trust’s clinical 

coding or reporting systems. Injury details such as nature and severity may be recorded within 

individual patient notes or free-text fields; however, this information is not structured in a way 

that would allow extraction or analysis specifically in relation to pothole-related causes. 

In accordance with Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust confirms it 

does not hold the requested information. 

Advice and Assistance: 

If you are seeking aggregated national or regional data, you may wish to contact NHS England 

or NHS Digital (now part of NHS England), as they hold wider datasets across the healthcare 

system that may include more granular information. 
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If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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