
Our Ref: 420 
July 2025 
 
 
Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 

 

Please provide the total number of patients treated where wound care represented the 

primary reason for admission, in the financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 2023-24, 

iv) 2024-25. If available, please provide a breakdown of inpatients compared to 

outpatients/community visits. 

 

The Trust does not centrally record admissions or attendances with 'wound care' as the 

primary reason in a searchable or reportable format. Diagnoses and activity data are 
recorded using ICD-10 codes, and 'wound care' is not a standalone diagnostic category. 
Providing this information would require a manual review of patient records to 
determine the reason for admission or treatment, which would exceed the appropriate 
time and cost limits set out under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

 

 

Please provide the number of Full-Time Equivalent (FTE) staff delivering wound care 

services within your organisation, broken down by professional role (e.g. community 

nurse, tissue viability nurse, podiatrist), in the financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 

2023-24, iv) 2024-25. 

The information requested is not held in a centrally reportable format. To locate, retrieve and 

extract this information would require a manual review of records held across multiple 

departments and directorates, as each service area manages its own local staffing arrangements, 

and the Trust does not maintain a consolidated dataset that breaks down staff FTE by the specific 

wound care activities or clinic types listed. 

To retrieve the required information would involve manually collating data from various 

departments and records, and would exceed this time and cost limit. 

  

Under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust is not obliged to comply 

with a request for information if the estimated cost of doing so would exceed the appropriate cost 

limit, which is set at £450 (equivalent to 18 hours of staff time). Based on the level of manual 

interrogation required across various departments, it has been determined that processing this 

request would exceed this cost threshold. 
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Advice and Assistance – Section 16 

We would be happy to provide advice and assistance if you wish to refine your request. For 

example, if you were to focus on a specific staff group (such as Tissue Viability or Community 

Nursing teams) or a specific service area, it may be possible to identify and provide some of the 

requested information within the appropriate cost limit. 

 

 

Please provide the number of Tissue Viability Nurses (TVNs) employed by your Trust, in 

the financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 2023-24, iv) 2024-25. 

 

2021-22 = 7, 2022-23 = 7, 2023-24 = 7, 2024-2025 = 8. 

 

If available, please provide a breakdown of the nature of wounds or conditions most 

commonly referred to wound care services (e.g. pressure ulcers, leg ulcers, post-

operative wounds, diabetic foot ulcers, traumatic wounds) 

 

Data from 2024-25 show that there were 5071 wounds referred to the TV (tissue viability) 

service with the following: 
1.     Pressure ulcer = 1240 
2.     Moisture Associated Skin Damage (MASD) = 1200 
3.     Traumatic wound = 670 
4.     Skin Tears = 571 

5.     Surgical wound = 238 
6.     Unknown aetiology = 218 
7.     Leg ulcer unspecified = 169 
8.     Diabetic Foot Ulcer = 141 
9.     Dehisced Surgical Wound = 114 
10.  Lower Body Weeping Cellulitis = 93 
11.  Leg ulcer venous = 72 
12.  Lower Body Weeping Oedema/lymphoerrea = 55 
13.  Abscess = 54 
14.  Haematoma = 44 
15.  Ischaemic Foot Ulcer = 43 
16.  Fungating/Malignant Wound= 38 

17.  Leg Ulcer – Mixed = 32 
18.  Burn = 28 
19.  Problematic Primary Intention = 13 
20.  Leg Ulcer – Arterial =12 
21.  Upper Body Weeping Cellulitis = 8 
22.  Skin Graft = 7 
23.  Neuropathic Foot Ulcer = 6 
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24.  Upper Body Weeping Oedema = 3 
25.  Donor site = 2 

 

 

What is the average waiting time for an initial wound care assessment in the financial 

years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 2023-24, iv) 2024-25? 

 
We do not hold this information 
Our policy is for patients to have a skin inspection completed within 6 hours of arriving to the 
Trust as an inpatient and if any wounds are identified for a wound care assessment to be 
completed at that time. 

 

 

What is the average waiting time for a referral to a specialist tissue viability nurse in the 

financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 2023-24, iv) 2024-25? 

 
We do not hold this Information 
Our standard operational policy for inpatients is for all referrals to receive triage and virtual 
support with 72 hours. 

 

 

Please provide the total number of patients referred from A&E or minor injury/urgent care 

units to any form of wound care service, in the financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 

2023-24, iv) 2024-25. Please provide the total number of A&E and minor injury/urgent 

care unit admissions in each financial year for comparison. 

 

Following a thorough review, we can confirm that the Trust does not centrally record referrals 

from A&E or minor injury/urgent care units specifically to wound care services in a searchable 

or reportable format. 

While the Trust is able to report on the total number of A&E and minor injury/urgent care 

attendances, the referral destination and the reason for referral (such as wound care) are typically 

recorded in free-text clinical notes and not in a structured, coded field that would allow 

automated reporting. 

To obtain the specific number of referrals to wound care services from these areas, it would be 

necessary to conduct a manual review of individual patient records to identify: 

 Whether a referral was made. 

 Whether the referral was specifically for wound care. 

Given the high volume of attendances, this manual review would exceed the appropriate cost and 

time limit as set out in Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
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Application of Section 12 

Under Section 12 of the Act, public authorities are not required to comply with a request if the 

cost of compliance would exceed the appropriate limit, which is £450 or 18 hours of staff time 

for NHS Trusts. We have estimated that extracting and reviewing each relevant record would far 

exceed this threshold. 

 

 

Please provide total spend on wound management dressings via Part IXA of the drug 

tariff (see link below), in the financial years i) 2021-22, ii) 2022-23, iii) 2023-24, iv) 2024-

25. https://www.drugtariff.nhsbsa.nhs.uk/#/00726198-DD/DD00726112/Part%20IXA-

%20Wound%20Management%20Dressings 
 

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust does not capture this 
information based on Drug Tariff classifications (such as Part IXA). The Trust’s procurement and 
financial systems do not categorise spend by Drug Tariff sections, and therefore we are unable 
to provide a breakdown in the format requested. 

Wound management dressings may be procured through various routes, including clinical 
stores, pharmacy stock, and bespoke supply arrangements, making it difficult to isolate the 
relevant expenditure solely in relation to Part IXA items. 

 
If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request an 

internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 working days 

from the date of this response, and should be addressed to d.wraith@nhs.net. 

  

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

  

Information Commissioner's Office 

 Wycliffe House 

 Water Lane 

 Wilmslow 

 Cheshire 

 SK9 5AF 

 Tel: 0303 123 1113 

 Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 

 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.drugtariff.nhsbsa.nhs.uk%2F%23%2F00726198-DD%2FDD00726112%2FPart%2520IXA-%2520Wound%2520Management%2520Dressings&data=05%7C02%7Cd.wraith%40nhs.net%7C69f03190e6c74b73534508ddba1a23ba%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638871343730420205%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=5ou%2FM%2FRK%2FNaMSIEG5%2Bk7c3GS13SW2DTEWo06MrFQh3k%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.drugtariff.nhsbsa.nhs.uk%2F%23%2F00726198-DD%2FDD00726112%2FPart%2520IXA-%2520Wound%2520Management%2520Dressings&data=05%7C02%7Cd.wraith%40nhs.net%7C69f03190e6c74b73534508ddba1a23ba%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C638871343730420205%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=5ou%2FM%2FRK%2FNaMSIEG5%2Bk7c3GS13SW2DTEWo06MrFQh3k%3D&reserved=0
mailto:d.wraith@nhs.net
https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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