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Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following information:

Please can | request the below information on the utilisation of Insourcing for the
following period 01/04/2025-30/06/2025

1. Total spend during the period for Insourcing for the below specialties:

e Neurology

e Neurophysiology

o Dermatology

o Gastroenterology

e Endoscopy

o Cardiology

o Respiratory

e Orthodontics / Dental
e OMFS

o ENT

« Rheumatology

e Gynaecology

e Ophthalmology

e Surgery- including all subspecialties

Please break the spend down by insourcing company

The Trust is withholding the breakdown of spend by insourcing company under Section 43(2) of
the Freedom of Information Act 2000, as disclosure would, or would be likely to, prejudice the
commercial interests of both the Trust and the individual insourcing providers.

Releasing company-specific spend information for the above specialties would risk revealing
commercially sensitive data such as pricing structures, service volumes, and supplier presence.
This could:

o Undermine the Trust’s ability to secure best value in future commercial negotiations.

« Provide competitors with insight into the commercial arrangements of specific suppliers,
affecting those suppliers’ ability to compete fairly in the market.

o Lead to market distortion, especially where there is limited supplier availability for
certain specialist services.

The Trust recognises the public interest in transparency and accountability in the use of public
funds. However, we consider that this interest is outweighed by the potential harm to the Trust’s
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and the suppliers’ commercial interests, and the negative impact on future procurement
outcomes.

This part of your request is therefore exempt under Section 43(2) of the Freedom of Information

Act.

2. Please confirm if there was a budget for insourcing for the specialties outlined

during the same period

Yes

3. What was the service type relating to the specialties outlined below, for example,

outpatient, diagnostic or theatres.

Was it a fully managed service or Team provision

. Neurolo%‘

Dermatology
Gastroenterology
Endoscopy
Cardiology
Respiratory
Orthodontics / Dental
OMFS

Rheumatology

Gynaecology

Ophthalmology

Surgery- including all subspecialties

4. Please can you confirm the Frameworks utilised for each specialty below

Neurology

Neurophysiology — NOE CPCRM6276
Dermatology

Gastroenterology

Endoscopy

Cardiology

Respiratory

Orthodontics / Dental

OMFS
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o ENT RM6276
« Rheumatology
e Gynaecology
e Ophthalmology
e Surgery- including all subspecialties

5. Please confirm any direct awards or mini competitions which are being utilised
for each specialty

Direct award — under PSR as they were services

6. Total procedures completed by insourcing companies for the specialties outlined
below during the same period

e Neurology

e Neurophysiology

« Dermatology

o Gastroenterology

e Endoscopy

o Cardiology

e Respiratory

e Orthodontics / Dental
e OMFS

o ENT

« Rheumatology

o Gynaecology

e Ophthalmology

e Surgery- including all subspecialties

The Trust’s reporting systems do not record procedure volumes in a format that attributes
activity to individual insourcing companies. Activity is captured at specialty or service level but
is not routinely coded or disaggregated by provider type (e.g. internal staff vs. insourced
provider) or by company name. Therefore, we are unable to provide the requested breakdown by
insourcing company.

Exemption Applied — Section 43(2) Commercial Interests

Additionally, even if the data were available in the requested format, disclosure of the number of
procedures carried out by each insourcing company would be likely to prejudice the commercial
interests of both the Trust and the third-party providers. This is because procedure volumes could
be used to estimate contract value, capacity, and pricing, thereby undermining future
procurement and competitive processes.
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On this basis, the Trust is applying Section 43(2) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, as
disclosure would, or would be likely to, prejudice commercial interests.

Conclusion

In accordance with Section 1(1)(a) of the Act, we confirm that the Trust does not hold the
requested information in the format specified. Furthermore, to the extent that any such
information could be inferred or compiled, it is exempt under Section 43(2) for the reasons
outlined above.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request an
internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 working days
from the date of this response, and should be addressed to d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office
Wycliffe House
Water Lane
Wilmslow
Cheshire
SK9 5AF
Tel: 0303 123 1113
Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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