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Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information:

The request relates to home enteral tube feeding, which is a way of providing nutrition to people who
can't eat and drink normally. Dietitians within your organisation will likely be best placed to help with
this information request.

1. Does your organisation provide care to individuals aged 0-25 who may use home enteral feeding
tubes? Yes

2.  How many patients has your organisation provided dietetic care for home enteral tube feeding
between 01-01-2023-31-12-2024?

a. Divided into the following age categories: 0-18, 18-25, 25+ (age when they joined the caseload or
age on 01-01-23 if they were on the caseload throughout this period).

b. If possible, please provide caseload numbers by age (e.g. <1, 1-2, 2-3... years etc.)

The Trust has been able to provide you with the attached spreadsheet which contains data we
were able to obtain within the appropriate limits.

However, with regard to part 2(b) of your request (caseload numbers by individual year of age),
the Trust is unable to provide this information. The data is not held in a readily reportable format
and responding would require a manual review of individual patient records to determine the
breakdown requested. We estimate that this exercise would exceed the appropriate cost limit set
out under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Section 12(1) provides that a public authority is not obliged to comply with a request if the
authority estimates that the cost of complying would exceed the appropriate limit, which is
currently set at 18 hours of staff time or £450.

3. Of these, how many individuals use a blended diet*?
a. Divided in the following age categories: 0-18, 18-25, 25+

The Trust does not hold this information. While DBTH provides dietetic care for some patients
on home enteral tube feeding, a significant proportion of these patients are managed by dietitians
employed by Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust (RDaSH). As
such, we are unable to provide the number of adults or children using a blended diet, as these
patients may fall under a different department and service.

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the FOIA, DBTH confirms that it does not hold the information
requested.
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Advice and assistance (Section 16 FOIA):
For information relating to dietetic services, including patients on blended diets managed within
the community, you may wish to contact RDaSH directly:

Rotherham Doncaster and South Humber NHS Foundation Trust (RDaSH)
FOI Team
Email: rdash.foi@nhs.net

b. If possible, please provide caseload numbers by age (e.g. <1, 1-2, 2-3... years etc.)

The Trust is unable to provide the caseload numbers by individual year of age. This information
is not held in a reportable format and could only be obtained through a manual review of
individual patient records. We estimate that retrieving and compiling this data would exceed the
appropriate cost limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (18 hours of
staff time or £450).

4. Does your organisation have the following: See spreadsheet
a. Local blended diet policy — Acute setting (Yes/No)
Local blended diet policy — Community setting (Yes/No)
Blended diet guideline (Yes/No)
Blended diet standard operating guideline or procedure (Yes/No)
Blended diet training package (Yes/No)
If yes to 4a-4e, please provide a copy.
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5. Are any staff employed by your organisation in roles funded by income provided by an enteral
feeding provider (e.g. Nutricia, Abbott)?
a. Ifyes, please state number of posts (whole time equivalent) and Agenda for
Change banding.

The Trust acknowledges your request for information regarding posts funded by private sector
suppliers. While we aim to be as transparent as possible, we must also consider our obligations
under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, particularly where exemptions apply.

In this instance, the Trust is applying the exemption under Section 43(2) — Commercial
Interests of the FOIA. This exemption applies where disclosure of information would, or would
be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of any person or organisation, including the Trust
and its suppliers.

The information requested relates to contractual arrangements with third-party suppliers.
Disclosure could potentially:

o Undermine the Trust’s ability to negotiate future contracts on competitive terms.

o Prejudice the commercial position of the supplier by revealing sensitive financial
arrangements.

o Deter private sector partners from engaging in future collaborations with the NHS due to
concerns over confidentiality.

Public interest test:
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We recognise there is a public interest in transparency regarding the use of public resources and
in ensuring accountability for contractual relationships with private sector suppliers. However,
there is also a strong public interest in protecting the Trust’s and its suppliers’ commercial
positions, safeguarding fair competition in the marketplace, and maintaining confidence of
current and future partners to engage with the NHS.

On balance, the Trust considers that the public interest in maintaining this exemption outweighs
the public interest in disclosure. Accordingly, the requested information is withheld under
Section 43(2) of the FOIA.

b.
*A blended diet is the use of everyday foods blended to a puree and given via an enteral feeding tube.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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