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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 

 

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 

 

 
1. Total Number of cath labs in your Health Board 

2. Any trusts within the Health Board considering procuring managed cardiology services 

 

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (DBTH) is an individual 

NHS Trust and does not hold data at the wider Health Board level. Responsibility for overseeing 

and coordinating services across multiple NHS providers within the region falls under the South 

Yorkshire Integrated Care Board (ICB). 

As such, this part of your request would be best directed to the South Yorkshire ICB, who may 

be able to provide information regarding the total number of cardiac catheterisation laboratories 

across the wider area they commission services for. 

Contact details and FOI submission guidance for South Yorkshire ICB can be found via their 

website: 

https://southyorkshire.icb.nhs.uk 

 

 Waiting list time by HRG code for cath lab procedure as of 1st June 2025 
 Waiting list time for New Patient Consultation as of 1st June 2025 

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching 
Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust confirms that it does not hold the information requested in the format 
specified. 

The Trust does not have a dedicated cardiac catheterisation laboratory (“cath lab”) in the same way as 
larger tertiary centres. While we do not operate a designated x-ray room exclusively for cardiology, the 
Trust does have two Digital Subtraction Angiography (DSA) suites. Both can undertake cardiac 
procedures, although one is occupied for cardiac work for approximately five sessions. 

In the purest sense, designated cath labs are located at Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation 
Trust (STH), who are the regional provider of tertiary cardiology services. Patients requiring such 
procedures are typically referred to STH. 

Accordingly: 
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Waiting list times by HRG code for cath lab procedures are not held by this Trust. This information may 
be available from Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust, who can be contacted via their FOI 
team: [sth.foi@nhs.net]. 

Waiting list times for new patient cardiology consultations at DBTH are managed within general 
outpatient pathways and are not reported separately under a “cath lab” category. 

 

 Waiting list time for Cardiac CT as of 1st June 2025- from date of referral is 4 weeks on an 

urgent/routine pathway 

 Waiting list time for Cardiac MRI as of 1st June 2025- The Average Wait time for Cardiac MRI is 

currently 7 weeks 

 Waiting list time for Transthoracic Echo as of 1st June 2025 – 5 weeks 
 Waiting list time for ambulatory monitor fitting as of 1st June 2025 – 6 weeks 

 

 

 The number of cath labs are in each Trust 
 The age of each cath lab 
 Any plans to refurbish any of these cath labs 

 

Under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, Doncaster and Bassetlaw 
Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust confirms that it does not hold the information 
requested. 

The Trust does not have a dedicated cardiac catheterisation laboratory (“cath lab”) in the same 
way as larger tertiary centres. While DBTH has two Digital Subtraction Angiography (DSA) suites 
which can undertake some cardiac procedures, these are not designated cath labs. 

Designated cath labs for this region are located at Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation 
Trust (STH), who are the tertiary provider of specialist cardiology services. Therefore, 
information on: 

 the number of cath labs, 

 the age of each cath lab, and 

 any refurbishment plans 

is not held by DBTH and may be available from Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation 
Trust. Their FOI team can be contacted via: [sth.foi@nhs.net]. 

mailto:sth.foi@nhs.net
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If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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