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Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 

  

 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information please:  

 

 
 

Freedom of Information Act Request 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information 
please: 

1. The current total number of patients on the vascular non-admitted waiting list at 

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust split into: 

a. Arteria patients 

b. Venous patients 

The latest published data is June 2025. At the end of June 2025 there were 1174 patients in Vascular 
Surgery waiting on a non-admitted pathway. We are unable to split into Arterial and Venous. 
 

2. The current number of patients on the vascular non-admitted waiting list who have 

already waited: 

The latest published data is June 2025. 
a. Longer than 65 weeks 

0 
 

b. Between 52 and 64 weeks 

13 
c. Between 40 and 51 weeks 

45 
d. Between 18 and 39 weeks 

255 
e. Less than 18 weeks 

861 
3. How long is your longest non-admitted waiter? 

The latest published data is June 2025. 
It is 58 weeks. 

 

4. For routine venous patients being referred now, what month are you booking them into 

for their first outpatient appointment? 
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The Trust does not hold this information in a way that can be readily extracted. 

Appointment booking dates can vary depending on a number of factors, including referral 

type, patient choice, clinical urgency, and consultant availability. Our systems do not 

provide a reportable field that would allow us to identify, at the present time, what month 

routine venous patients being referred now are being booked into for their first outpatient 

appointment. 

Under Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust confirms that it 

does not hold this information in a retrievable format. To provide a precise answer would 

require a manual review of individual patient records, which we estimate would exceed 

the appropriate time limit under Section 12 of the FOIA (cost of compliance). 

Patients referred to the Trust are managed in line with national referral-to-treatment 

(RTT) standards, and further information about waiting times can be found in published 

NHS England statistics: 

https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-areas/rtt-waiting-times 

 

5. The current number of patients on the admitted waiting list that are listed for varicose 

vein intervention, either unilateral or bilateral. This could be: 

a. Radiofrequency ablation (RFA) 

b. Foam sclerotherapy 

c. Phlebectomies/avulsions 

d. Vein stripping 

e. Endovenous laser treatment (EVLT) 

The latest published data is June 2025. 
There were 12 patients on the Vascular admitted waiting list listed for varicose vein intervention. 

 
6. The average full RTT waiting time for varicose vein patients 

For those admitted and treated in June 2025 for varicose vein intervention, the mean wait was 
30 weeks. 
 

7. Where do you treat your varicose vein patients? Is it in Main Theatre, Minor Ops, or an 

Outpatient setting? Endovenous in Out patients, Open in main theatre 

8. How many varicose vein patients would you normally treat on an intervention list? 

Please could you provide this information broken down by half day or full day list? 

½ day – endovenous 4,   open 2 

9. Do you run pure varicose vein intervention lists or are patients mixed into regular 

vascular lists?  Usually pure vein lists at spoke hospitals 

10. Do your varicose vein patients attend a one stop diagnostic and consultation 

appointment? Yes usually 

11. If not, how long is your current wait for a diagnostic appointment?  

https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-areas/rtt-waiting-times/?utm_source=chatgpt.com
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Please could you provide this data for the most recent PTL available. 
If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request an 
internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 working days 
from the date of this response, and should be addressed to d.wraith@nhs.net. 
If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 
Information Commissioner's Office 
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
Tel: 0303 123 1113 
Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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