NHS
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September 2025 Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following information:

Question 1: How many children presented at your trust with rotting teeth in the month of
October 2024, the week of the 28th October 2024 and the week of 4th November.

Please could you provide this information by email, preferably in a spreadsheet.

If it is not possible to provide the information requested due to the information exceeding the
cost of compliance limits identified in Section 12, please provide advice and assistance,
under the Section 16 obligations of the Act, as to how | can refine my request.

The Trust has reviewed your request. Our data systems do not hold information in a format that
identifies “rotting teeth” as a diagnostic category or data set. As such, we are unable to provide
the figures you have requested.

It may be possible to identify some dental-related attendances through broader diagnostic coding
(e.g. dental caries), but this would not specifically equate to “rotting teeth” and therefore would
not provide an accurate or reliable answer to your request.

Please note that hospital Trusts, including Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals, do not
generally provide routine paediatric dentistry. Our role is limited to urgent and emergency care
in certain circumstances, therefore our records will not reflect overall trends in childhood oral
health.

Accordingly, under Section 1(1)(a) of the FOIA, the Trust confirms it does not hold the
information you have requested.

For further information, you may wish to contact:

e NHS England (who commission dental services nationally) —
https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:


https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/?utm_source=chatgpt.com
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Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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