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Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following information:

1. Whether individual photographers, or representatives from any newborn photography
companies, are present on the hospital's postnatal ward

Yes — DRI site only
If "yes", please provide:
1. The names of these companies or individuals — Bonniebabi LTD

2. The date since which these companies have been present on the ward

The Trust does not hold this information. Our Maternity Service has confirmed that records are
not maintained in a way which would allow us to ascertain the date since which companies may
have been present on the ward. Accordingly, this information is not available.

Under Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, a public authority is only obliged to
provide recorded information it holds. As this information is not held, we are unable to provide a
response to your request.

3. The hours and days of the week when these companies are present on the ward
Mon-Sat 10-2

4. Full copies of all training or guidance materials provided by the hospital to the
photographers, including (but not limited to) how they should interact with patients when
on the ward, how to obtain consent from patients, and safeguarding training

The Trust does not hold this information. Bonniebabi photographers are not employees of
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust, and as such we are not
responsible for providing their safeguarding or other training. We would expect this to be
covered under the company’s own internal safeguarding policies and procedures, which are
reviewed as part of the procurement processes. In addition, employees of Bonniebabi Ltd are
always chaperoned by Trust staff and are not left unattended when on our wards or clinical
areas. Therefore, the Trust does not hold the requested training or guidance materials. Under
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, a public authority is obliged to provide
recorded information it holds

5. Details of whether the hospital conducts DBS checks or other background checks on
these photographers
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The Trust does not hold this information. Bonniebabi photographers are not employees of
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust, and therefore the Trust does
not undertake DBS or other background checks for them. As part of the procurement process,
however, the Trust seeks assurance that organisations providing services on our sites have
appropriate safeguarding and employment checks in place. In addition, employees of
Bonniebabi Ltd are always chaperoned by Trust staff and are not left unattended when on our
wards or clinical areas. Therefore, the Trust does not hold the requested information. Under
Section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, a public authority is obliged to provide
recorded information it holds. The Trust does not hold individual DBS records for Bonniebabi
photographers.

6. Details of the financial arrangements between the hospital and the photography
companies, including (but not limited to) the amount paid by the photographers or
photography companies to the hospital. Please break this down by calendar year, from
the starting date of the hospital's contract with the company.

The Trust acknowledges your request for information regarding the financial arrangements with
photography companies. While we seek to be as open and transparent as possible, we must also
consider our obligations under the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

The information you have requested is considered commercially sensitive and is therefore
exempt under Section 43(2) of the FOIA (Commercial Interests). Disclosure of this
information would, or would be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of both the Trust
and the companies involved.

Releasing these details could:

e Undermine the Trust’s ability to negotiate competitive terms in future contracts with
photography and other commercial providers.

o Prejudice the commercial position of the suppliers by disclosing sensitive financial
arrangements to competitors.

o Deter private sector partners from entering into contracts with the NHS due to concerns
that confidential commercial information may be disclosed.

Public interest test:

We recognise that there is a public interest in transparency regarding the use of NHS premises
and resources, and in demonstrating that the Trust secures appropriate value from commercial
arrangements. However, there is also a significant public interest in protecting the Trust’s ability
to secure the best possible terms in future negotiations, as well as safeguarding the commercial
confidence of current suppliers.
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On balance, we consider that the public interest in maintaining the exemption outweighs the
public interest in disclosure. Accordingly, the requested information is withheld under Section
43(2) of the FOIA.

7. Has the hospital received any complaints from patients or their families about the
behaviour of photographers?

No

1. The number of complaints received, broken down by calendar year, from the starting
date of the hospital's contract with the company.
NA

2. If available, the anonymised content of the complaints
NA

3. Details of any action taken by the hospital as a result of these complaints
NA

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner'’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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