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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 regarding 
the workforce supporting head and neck cancer services within your Cancer Alliance. I have 
contacted NHS South Yorkshire who advise me to re-direct my request to the trust 
providers within the South Yorkshire Cancer Alliance. 
 
Please could you provide the following information, ideally based on the most recent data 
available (and please indicate the date of data collection if possible): 
1. The number of individuals currently working within DBTH in the following roles, 
where they are involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer: 
- Consultant Clinical Oncologists 
- Consultant Medical Oncologists 
- Head and Neck Surgeons (ENT, OMFS and plastic surgeons specialising in head and 
neck) 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 12 ENT consultants 

 There are no Oral and Maxillofacial (OMFS) surgeons. 

However, our data systems do not record subspecialty information. It is therefore not possible to 

determine whether any of the above consultants have a cancer specialty. Accordingly, this 

specific information is not held under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act. 

 
- Consultant Radiologists (with head and neck subspecialty, if available) 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 21 consultant Radiologists 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these consultants have a sub-

specialty in head and neck. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

consultants involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under Section 

1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
- Therapeutic Radiographers 
There are no Therapeutic Radiographers  
 
- Diagnostic Radiographers 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 171 Diagnostic Radiographers 
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It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these consultants have a sub-

specialty in head and neck. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

consultants involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under Section 

1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 

 
- Pathologists 
 

Please note that the pathology service at Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals (DBTH) 

transferred under TUPE (Transfer of Undertakings – Protection of Employment) regulations in 

April 2024 to a centralised pathology model hosted by Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS 

Foundation Trust (STH), as part of the South Yorkshire and Bassetlaw Pathology transformation 

programme. 

Accordingly, this information is not held by DBTH under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of 

Information Act 2000. 

Any requests for pathology information from April 2024 onwards should be directed to: 

Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust 

Freedom of Information Team 

Email:mailto:sth.foi@nhs.net 

 
- Speech and Language Therapists (SLTs) 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 43 Speech and Language Therapist 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these individuals have a sub-

specialty in head and neck. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on SLTs 

involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under Section 1(1)(a) of the 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
 
- Clinical Nurse Specialists (CNSs) for Head and Neck Cancer 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 4 CNSs 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these individuals have a sub-

specialty in head and neck cancer. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

CNSs involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under Section 

1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

mailto:sth.foi@nhs.net
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- Dietitians (working with head and neck cancer patients) 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 34 Dietitians 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these individuals have a sub-

specialty in head and neck cancer. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

dietitians involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under Section 

1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
 
- Psychologists or Counsellors (working with head and neck cancer patients) 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 2 psychologists or counsellors 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these individuals have a sub-

specialty in head and neck cancer. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

psychologists or counsellors involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not 

held under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
 
 
- Maxillofacial Prosthetists or Technologists 
 
None 
 
- MDT Coordinators 
 

We can confirm that we hold some information relevant to your request: 

 The Trust employs 11 MDT Coordinators 

 

It is not possible to identify from our data system whether any of these individuals have a sub-

specialty in head and neck cancer. Accordingly, the specific information you have requested on 

these individuals involved in the care of patients with head and neck cancer is not held under 

Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

 
 
2. For each of the above roles, if possible, please also include: 
- Number of Whole-Time Equivalent (WTE) staff 
- Number of current vacancies (headcount and WTE)- Any known workforce planning or 
succession data, including anticipated retirements 
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within the next 5 years 
 

  Headcount: This information is not held. The Trust does not record its vacancies or 

workforce data on a headcount basis. 

  Whole-Time Equivalent (WTE): 583.99 

  Workforce Planning / Succession Data  

 The Trust does hold some information relating to workforce planning and succession. 

However, with regard to anticipated retirements within the next five years, this information is 

exempt from disclosure under Section 40(2) (Personal information) and Section 36 

(Prejudice to effective conduct of public affairs)  

The reason for this is that retirement planning is based on personal choices and circumstances 

which may change and therefore constitutes subjective information. Disclosure could be 

misleading, and may also identify or be linked to individuals.  
 

 

 

I would prefer the information in electronic format (e.g., Excel or CSV) if available. 

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
 

 
 
 
  
 
 

https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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