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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 

 

For the 6-month period ending 30th September 2025, can you please provide: 

 

1. Total Framework Agency Spend for the below specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

 

2. Total Off Framework Agency Spend for the below specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

3. Total hours filled by Framework Agencies for the below specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

4. Total hours filled by Off Framework Agencies for the below specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

5. A list of all Framework Agencies utilised by the Trust for the below specialties and 

total number of shifts for each framework agency: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

6. A list of all Off Framework Agencies utilised by the Trust for the below specialties 

and total number of shifts for each Off Framework agency: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 
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7. The highest Framework Agency Charge Rate within your Trust for each of the below 

specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

8. The highest Off Framework Agency Charge Rate within your Trust for each of the 

below specialties: 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 

 

9. A list of any agency (Framework and Off Framework) that have ongoing block 

booking arrangements for the below specialties within your Trust within the identified 

time frame (01.03.2025 - 30.09.2025): 

- NHS 111 Health Advisors 

- NHS 111 Clinical Advisors 

- Nurse Assessors 
 
  

I can confirm under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000 that Doncaster and 

Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust does not hold this information. 

The reasons are as follows: 

 NHS 111 Health Advisors / Clinical Advisors: NHS 111 services are not operated by 

this Trust. These services are commissioned regionally and delivered by Yorkshire 

Ambulance Service NHS Trust. You may therefore wish to redirect this part of your 

request to them. 

 Nurse Assessors: The role of Nurse Assessor is associated with Continuing Healthcare 

(CHC) assessments, which are the responsibility of the South Yorkshire Integrated Care 

Board (ICB), not acute Trusts such as DBTH. 

For your convenience, contact details are provided below: 

 Yorkshire Ambulance Service NHS Trust FOI: foi@yas.nhs.uk 

 NHS South Yorkshire ICB FOI: syicb.foi@nhs.net 

Section 16 duty to advise and assist: In line with our obligations under Section 16 of the 

Freedom of Information Act, we have signposted you to the organisations most likely to hold the 

information relevant to your request. 

As such, this Trust does not hold the information you have requested. 
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If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
 

 
 
 
  
 
 
 
  

 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/


Our Ref: 607 
October 2025 
 
 
 
 

 


