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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 

 

Please provide the following information for the period 1 April 2020 to 31 March 2025, broken 

down by financial year: 

 

 

1) Total expenditure by the Trust on pest control services, including both in-house provision and 

external/contracted services. 

 

For the period 1 April 2020 to 31 March 2025, the Trust’s total expenditure on pest control 

services is £55,966.87. 

The Trust is unable to provide a breakdown by individual financial year. Disclosure of 

expenditure by year would, or would be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of both the 

Trust and its supplier, as the services are provided under a single contract with one supplier. 

Releasing year-by-year spend data could allow the supplier’s pricing structure and commercial 

performance to be inferred, potentially undermining the Trust’s ability to secure best value in 

future procurements. 

Accordingly, this information is exempt under Section 43(2) – Commercial Interests of the 

Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Public Interest Test 

The Trust recognises the general public interest in transparency regarding the use of public 

funds. However, this is outweighed by the potential harm to the Trust’s and supplier’s 

commercial interests. Disclosure could prejudice the Trust’s negotiating position and distort fair 

competition in future tendering exercises. On balance, the Trust considers that maintaining the 

exemption outweighs the public interest in disclosure. 

 

 

2) If any services are contracted out, please provide the supplier name(s) and the contract 

value(s). 

 

The Trust can confirm that pest management services are contracted out to Shield Pest 

Management. 

However, the specific contract value is withheld under Section 43(2) of the Freedom of 

Information Act 2000 – Commercial Interests. This exemption applies where disclosure of the 

information would, or would be likely to, prejudice the commercial interests of any person, 

including the public authority holding it. 
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Releasing the contract value could undermine the Trust’s ability to obtain best value in future 

tendering exercises by prejudicing the supplier’s competitive position and the Trust’s negotiating 

power in similar procurements. 

Public Interest Test 

In applying Section 43(2), the Trust has considered the balance of public interest. While there is 

a general public interest in transparency and accountability regarding the use of public funds, this 

is outweighed by the potential harm to both the Trust’s and the supplier’s commercial interests. 

Disclosure could adversely affect the Trust’s ability to achieve value for money in future 

procurement processes. 

Accordingly, the Trust considers that maintaining the exemption outweighs the public interest in 

disclosure. 

 

 

3) The number of call-outs/treatments by species category (e.g. rats, mice, pigeons, gulls, foxes, 

grey squirrels, wasps, bedbugs, cockroaches—please use your own categories if recorded 

differently). 

 The Trust does not hold this information in a reportable format. 

The pest control services are delivered by an external contractor, and while records of service 

visits are retained, these are not categorised or stored in a way that would allow the Trust to 

identify and report on the number of call-outs or treatments by species type. 

To extract this level of detail would require a manual review of individual service logs, which 

would exceed the cost and time limits under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 

2000 (requests exceeding the appropriate limit). 

As such, under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, the Trust confirms that it does 

not hold the requested information in the format specified. 

 

4) For any lethal control commissioned or carried out by the Trust, the number of animals killed 

by species and, where recorded, the method used (e.g. trapping, poisoning, shooting). 

  

The Trust does not hold this information in a reportable format. 

While the Trust commissions pest control services through an external contractor, detailed 

records of the number of animals controlled and the methods used (e.g. trapping, poisoning, or 

other) are not held or categorised in a way that allows this data to be reported. 

To obtain this level of detail would require a manual review of individual service records, which 

would exceed the cost and time limits under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 

2000 (requests exceeding the appropriate limit). 

Accordingly, under Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act, the Trust confirms that it 

does not hold the requested information in the format specified. 
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5) A copy of any policy, guidance, or standard operating procedure relating to the Trust’s pest 

control service or contractors. 

 

See attached 
 

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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