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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 

 
1. How many staff members have taken part in training on new technology systems in your Trust over the last 

five years (from 2020 to 2025)? 

 

 
2. How much has been spent on training staff members on new technology systems in your Trust over the last 

five years (from 2020 to 2025)? 

 
 

The Trust does not hold this information in a reportable format. 

Training on new technology systems is delivered across multiple departments and digital 

platforms (for example, system-specific onboarding, software rollouts, and eLearning modules). 

Records of attendance and associated costs are managed locally by the individual service areas or 

included within wider digital project budgets rather than recorded centrally under a single 

“technology training” category. 

As such, there is no single dataset or register that would enable the Trust to accurately report the 

number of staff trained or the total amount spent over the period requested. Compiling this 

information would require a manual review of training records, finance codes, and project 

documentation across several departments, which would exceed the appropriate cost and time 

limit under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 

Additionally, as the requested information is not held in a consolidated or reportable format, the 

Trust is applying Section 1(1)(a) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, confirming that it 

does not hold the information requested. 

 

In accordance with Section 16 (Duty to Provide Advice and Assistance), we have considered 
whether there are any feasible steps that could be taken to help refine the request. However, as 
this information is not collated centrally or held in any searchable format, there is no practical 
way to identify or provide it through refinement. 
 
 

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 
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Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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