NHS

Our Ref: 648 Doncaster and Bassetlaw

October 2025 Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following information:

1. General sickness absence from 2020-2025:
e The total number of staff sickness absence days taken each year, broken down by
year from 2020-2025.

Year FTE Days lost Headcount
01/04/2024-31/03/2025 134054.06 6,130
01/04/2023-31/03/2024 131158.27 6,728
01/04/2022-31/03/2023 130665.17 6,318
01/04/2021-31/03/2022 130888.69 6,327
01/04/2020-31/03/2021 112974.79 6,221

2. Categorisation of sickness absence:

e Does your organisation code sickness absences by specific category or reason (e.g.
‘mental health’, ‘burnout’, ‘flu’, ‘musculoskeletal issues’)? Yes

e Ifyes, please provide the breakdown for each recorded sickness category for each
year in the five-year period (2020-2025).

01/04/2024 — 31/03/2025

Sum of FTE Days
Row Labels Lost

S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other psychiatric

illnesses 41590.62
S11 Back Problems 2612.49
S12 Other musculoskeletal problems 21114.85
S13 Cold, Cough, Flu - Influenza 12105.58
S14 Asthma 316.82
S15 Chest & respiratory problems 2198.87
S16 Headache / migraine 3057.47
S17 Benign and malignant tumours, cancers 4208.03
S18 Blood disorders 399.56
S19 Heart, cardiac & circulatory problems 3587.21
S20 Burns, poisoning, frostbite, hypothermia 181.80
S21 Ear, nose, throat (ENT) 2566.91
S22 Dental and oral problems 505.14
S23 Eye problems 1086.82

S24 Endocrine / glandular problems 637.41
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S25 Gastrointestinal problems

S26 Genitourinary & gynaecological disorders
S27 Infectious diseases

S28 Injury, fracture

S29 Nervous system disorders

S30 Pregnancy related disorders

S31 Skin disorders

S32 Substance abuse

S98 Other known causes - not elsewhere classified
S99 Unknown causes / Not specified

Grand Total

01/04/2023 — 31/03/2024

Row Labels

S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other psychiatric
illnesses

S11 Back Problems

S12 Other musculoskeletal problems

S13 Cold, Cough, Flu - Influenza

S14 Asthma

S15 Chest & respiratory problems

S16 Headache / migraine

S17 Benign and malignant tumours, cancers
S18 Blood disorders

S19 Heart, cardiac & circulatory problems
S20 Burns, poisoning, frostbite, hypothermia
S21 Ear, nose, throat (ENT)

S22 Dental and oral problems

S23 Eye problems

S24 Endocrine / glandular problems

S25 Gastrointestinal problems

S26 Genitourinary & gynaecological disorders
S27 Infectious diseases

S28 Injury, fracture

S29 Nervous system disorders

S30 Pregnancy related disorders

S31 Skin disorders

S32 Substance abuse

S98 Other known causes - not elsewhere classified
S99 Unknown causes / Not specified

Grand Total

NHS

Doncaster and Bassetlaw

13480.08
5578.73
4853.27
6666.98
2229.35
3939.60

739.97

#

192.84

201.66
134054.06

Sum of FTE Days
Lost

38842.17
200.06
21948.86
9526.50
287.15
3449.25
3265.33
3455.83
706.57
2269.96
54.92
2159.23
470.41
1459.91
1084.01
11790.13
5296.80
10821.43
7737.68
2348.87
3233.86
650.21

#

94.80
3.35
131158.27

Teaching Hospitals

NHS Foundation Trust
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01/04/2022 — 31/03/2023

Row Labels

S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other psychiatric
illnesses

S11 Back Problems

S12 Other musculoskeletal problems

S13 Cold, Cough, Flu - Influenza

S14 Asthma

S15 Chest & respiratory problems

S16 Headache / migraine

S17 Benign and malignant tumours, cancers
S18 Blood disorders

S19 Heart, cardiac & circulatory problems
S20 Burns, poisoning, frostbite, hypothermia
S21 Ear, nose, throat (ENT)

S22 Dental and oral problems

S23 Eye problems

S24 Endocrine / glandular problems

S25 Gastrointestinal problems

S26 Genitourinary & gynaecological disorders
S27 Infectious diseases

S28 Injury, fracture

S29 Nervous system disorders

S30 Pregnancy related disorders

S31 Skin disorders

S32 Substance abuse

S98 Other known causes - not elsewhere classified
S99 Unknown causes / Not specified

Grand Total

01/04/2021 — 31/03/2022

Row Labels

$10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other psychiatric
illnesses

S11 Back Problems

S$12 Other musculoskeletal problems

S13 Cold, Cough, Flu - Influenza

NHS
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Sum of FTE Days
Lost

36013.72
246.84
17254.46
6454.30
213.41
2585.90
2688.60
4611.37
402.36
2668.89
62.19
1824.04
405.24
636.39
677.75
9591.11
3787.45
27169.01
7373.73
2574.35
3001.23
345.73

#

32.00
42.10
130665.17

Sum of FTE Days
Lost

35497.80
1019.42
17931.50
4067.33
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S$14 Asthma

S15 Chest & respiratory problems

S16 Headache / migraine

S17 Benign and malignant tumours, cancers
S$18 Blood disorders

S$19 Heart, cardiac & circulatory problems
S20 Burns, poisoning, frostbite, hypothermia
S21 Ear, nose, throat (ENT)

S22 Dental and oral problems

S23 Eye problems

S24 Endocrine / glandular problems

S25 Gastrointestinal problems

S26 Genitourinary & gynaecological disorders
S27 Infectious diseases

S28 Injury, fracture

$29 Nervous system disorders

S30 Pregnancy related disorders

S31 Skin disorders

S98 Other known causes - not elsewhere classified
S99 Unknown causes / Not specified

Grand Total

01/04/2020 — 31/03/2021

Row Labels

S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other psychiatric
illnesses

S11 Back Problems

S12 Other musculoskeletal problems

S13 Cold, Cough, Flu - Influenza

S14 Asthma

S15 Chest & respiratory problems

S16 Headache / migraine

S17 Benign and malignant tumours, cancers
S18 Blood disorders

S19 Heart, cardiac & circulatory problems
S20 Burns, poisoning, frostbite, hypothermia
S21 Ear, nose, throat (ENT)

S22 Dental and oral problems

S23 Eye problems

S24 Endocrine / glandular problems

S25 Gastrointestinal problems

S26 Genitourinary & gynaecological disorders

NHS
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94.53
3073.09
2670.15
4090.41

465.87
2157.52
135.47
2277.98
407.36
1063.72
449.32
9354.90
2052.09
29232.46
9258.66
1652.03
2935.48
931.00
30.00
40.60
130888.69

Sum of FTE Days
Lost

36081.49
2714.27
12477.58
2031.42
254.96
3287.44
2440.78
2770.98
431.96
1507.68
82.93
2192.56
426.56
551.15
669.32
7010.18
1850.69

Teaching Hospitals

NHS Foundation Trust
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S27 Infectious diseases 22734.84
S28 Injury, fracture 7753.98
S29 Nervous system disorders 1936.10
S30 Pregnancy related disorders 2598.33
S31 Skin disorders 559.75
S98 Other known causes - not elsewhere classified 296.61
S99 Unknown causes / Not specified 313.23
Grand Total 112974.79

Where figures are shown as #, this indicates that the actual number is fewer than five. The Trust
has replaced these with a symbol to reduce the risk of individuals being identifiable, either
directly or through combination with other information.

This information is therefore withheld under Section 40(2) of the Freedom of Information Act
2000, as disclosure could lead to the identification of individuals and would constitute personal
data as defined under the UK General Data Protection Regulation (UK GDPR) and Data
Protection Act 2018.

The Trust considers that the disclosure of such small numbers would be unfair and unlawful
under the first data protection principle. Therefore, these have been redacted and represented
with a # symbol.

e Ifsuch categorisations have changed over time, please indicate when changes to
categories or coding were implemented.

3. Locum and agency staff usage from 2020-2025:
e The total number of locum or agency staff engaged in each year of the five-year
period (2020-2025).

The Trust does not hold a centralised record of the total number of individual locum or
agency staff engaged each year. Engagements are managed across multiple departments
using various staffing systems and through different framework agencies, making it
impossible to produce a single, consolidated figure without manually reviewing
individual records.
Under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust is not obliged to
comply with a request where the cost of locating, retrieving, and extracting the
information would exceed the appropriate limit (£450 or 18 hours of staff time). In this
case, to identify the number of individual agency staff engaged per year would require a
manual search across all departmental records and agency systems, which would exceed
this threshold.

e Ifrecords permit, please detail the total expenditure on locum or agency staff for each
year.
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The Trust records agency and locum expenditure across a range of staff groups (medical,
nursing, AHP, administrative, estates and others) and via numerous agencies including,
but not limited to, Holt, Maxxima, Medacs, NHS Professionals and others. However,
there is no single dataset that itemises annual expenditure on locum or agency staffing
across all divisions and cost centres for the entire period requested.

To produce this information would require an extensive manual review of multiple ledger
codes and cost centres to isolate relevant payments, reconcile them to each staffing
category, and separate framework from non-framework spend. The work involved in
collating and verifying this information would exceed the time and cost limit set out
under Section 12(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

Therefore, this part of your request is also refused under Section 12(1).

e Ifpossible, please indicate whether the use of locum/agency staff was linked to
covering staff sickness absences.

The Trust does not hold this information in a reportable format. Reasons for agency
engagement (e.g., staff sickness, vacancy cover, or increased service demand) are not
consistently recorded across all systems. To identify this information would require manual
cross-checking of individual booking records and staff absence data across a five-year period,
which would again exceed the cost limit set out under Section 12(1) of the Act.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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