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Freedom of Information Act Request

Under the Freedom of Information Act, | would like to request the following information:

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, | would like to request the following information
relating to maternity services delivered by Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust:

1. How many pregnant women had communication needs flagged under the NHS Accessible
Information Standard (AIS) between 1 Jan 2020 and 31 Aug 2025?

2. Of these, how many were recorded as requiring British Sign Language (BSL) interpretation?

The Trust does not hold a reportable dataset identifying pregnant women who had
communication needs flagged under the Accessible Information Standard (AIS), or specifically
those recorded as requiring British Sign Language (BSL) interpretation.

Language assessments and interpretation needs are routinely recorded within the electronic
maternity systems which then inform personalised care and support plans. However whilst,
communication needs can be recorded within patient records, there is no single searchable field
that would allow this information to be extracted without reviewing individual patient files. As
such, this would exceed the appropriate cost limit under Section 12 of the Freedom of
Information Act 2000.

3. Number and percentage of instances where an in-person BSL interpreter was provided during:
» Antenatal/prenatal appointments
» Intrapartum period (labour and childbirth) - including but not limited to elective
caesarean section and emergency caesarean section.
» Neonatal period - including but not limited to intensive neonatal care.
» Postnatal/postpartum appointments - up to 12 months after the birth - including
but not limited to community midwife and health visitor appointments.
If this breakdown is not available, please provide the total number of occasions when
this was the case across all maternity services.

4. Number and percentage of instances where video remote interpreting (VRI) was used during:
» Antenatal/prenatal appointments
» Intrapartum period (labour and childbirth) - including but not limited to elective
caesarean section and emergency caesarean section
» Neonatal period - including but not limited to intensive neonatal care.
» Postnatal/postpartum appointments - up to 12 months after the birth - including
but not limited to community midwife and health visitor appointments.
If this breakdown is not available, please provide the total number of occasions when
this was the case across all maternity services.
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5. Number and percentage of instances where no interpreter was provided despite sign language
needs being recorded.
= Antenatal/prenatal appointments - including but not limited to elective caesarean
section and emergency caesarean section.
= Intrapartum period (labour and childbirth) - including but not limited to elective
caesarean section and emergency caesarean section
= Neonatal period - including but not limited to intensive neonatal care.
= Postnatal/postpartum appointments - up to 12 months after the birth - including
but not limited to community midwife and health visitor appointments.
If this breakdown is not available, please provide the total number of occasions when
this was the case across all maternity services.

Q3-5

The Trust’s interpreting service data is not recorded or reportable at the level of detail requested.
Interpreter bookings are logged centrally for the Trust as a whole, and not by specific service line
(e.g., maternity, neonatal, community midwifery).

Therefore, while we would be able to identify the number of BSL interpreter requests made
across the Women and Children’s Division, it is not possible to isolate these to maternity
services or to specific stages of the maternity pathway without a manual review of individual
bookings, which would again exceed the cost threshold under Section 12 of the Act.

6. The number of:

a. elective caesarean sections involving deaf, hard of hearing, hearing-impaired, or deafened
patients

b. emergency caesarean sections involving deaf, hard of hearing, hearing-impaired, or deafened
patients

If this breakdown is not available, please provide the total number of caesarean sections
- elective and emergency - involving deaf, hard of hearing, hearing-impaired, or deafened
patients.

The Trust does not hold this information in a reportable format. Patient hearing status is not
recorded as a standard data field within the maternity or theatre systems. Identifying these
records would require a review of individual patient notes, which would exceed the cost limit
under Section 12.

7. Number of Datix incidents, complaints, or serious incident reports between Jan 2020 — Aug
2025 involving deaf, hard of hearing, hearing impaired or deafened patients.

The Trust does not record or categorise Datix incident, complaint or serious incident data by
whether the patient is deaf, hard of hearing, hearing impaired or deafened.
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As such, there is no report or search function that would allow us to identify this information
without reviewing each individual record manually to determine if it may relate to a patient with
hearing loss. Given the number of records held over the requested timeframe, this exercise would
exceed the appropriate limit set under Section 12 (Exemption where cost of compliance exceeds
appropriate limit) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

However, for clarity, the Trust can confirm that deaf or hard of hearing status is not a standard
data field captured within the Datix system. Therefore, we do not hold the requested information
in a reportable format.

Summary:

In summary, while we can identify how many BSL interpreters have been requested for the
wider Women and Children’s Division, we are unable to provide data specifically for maternity
services or at the level of appointment type or clinical stage. The requested information is
therefore not held in a reportable format, and retrieval would exceed the cost limit under Section
12 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000.

If you would like to refine your request to data on overall BSL interpreter bookings for the
Women and Children’s Division within the specified period, we would be happy to consider this
under Section 16 (duty to assist).

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office

Wycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Tel: 0303 123 1113

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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