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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 
Please provide information regarding the following system contracts: 
1. Ambient Voice Technology (scribing) 

a) System type – No system in place 
b) Supplier name – 
c) System name – 
d) Date installed – 
e) Contract expiration – 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No 
h) Procurement framework – 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – 
j) Total value of contract (£) – 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 

 
2. Blood tracking 

a) System type – 
b) Supplier name – 
c) System name – 
d) Date installed – 
e) Contract expiration – 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No 
h) Procurement framework – 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – 
j) Total value of contract (£) – 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – Pathology contracts for Doncaster and Bassetlaw 
Teaching Hospitals (DBTH) now sit with Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (STH). 
Please contact Sheffield Teaching Hospitals for this information. Their FOI team can be reached via: 
sth.foi@nhs.net. 

 
3. Clinical data warehouse 

a) System type – This is an internally developed and maintained warehouse stored in SQL Databases 
b) Supplier name –Internally Developed. No supplier 
c) System name –Internally Developed. No supplier 
d) Date installed – 
e) Contract expiration – 
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f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Yes/No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes/No 
h) Procurement framework – 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – 
j) Total value of contract (£) – 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 

 
4. Clinical Portal 
System type – Clinical Portal 
b) Supplier name – Internal – Systems Development Team 
c) System name – Clinical Portal 
d) Date installed – June 2017 
e) Contract expiration – N/A 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Unknown 
h) Procurement framework – N/A 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – Active Directory, CaMIS, CVIS, Symphony, Datix, Infoflex, Nerve Centre, 
Wellsky, teletracker, medisec, bluespier, endovault, K2, Ice, eMed, SystmOne, Ifit 
j) Total value of contract (£) – 0 Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) –  
 
5. Health Information Exchange (HIE)  
System type – Integration / Interoperability 
b) Supplier name – Intersystems 
c) System name – Known internally as TIE (Trust Integration Engine) / Healthshare 
d) Date installed – N/A 
e) Contract expiration – N/A 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? – Yes – there are licenses that are renewed yearly. 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - No 
h) Procurement framework – N/A 
i) Other systems it integrates with? –  
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – No 
 
6. Live operational dashboard system 
System type – Live Operational Dashboard 
b) Supplier name – Internal – Systems Development Team 
c) System name – Wardboards 
d) Date installed – November 2019 
e) Contract expiration – N/A 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No  
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Unknown 
h) Procurement framework – N/A 
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i) Other systems it integrates with? – Nerve Center / CaMIS 
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – No 
 
7. Oncology e-prescribing –  
System type –Oncology e-prescribing 
b) Supplier name –Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (STH) 
c) System name –ChemoCare 
d) Date installed –The Trust does not hold this information. The ChemoCare system is hosted and managed 
by Sheffield Teaching Hospitals, and DBTH accesses the system via hosted arrangements. (Section 1(1), 
information not held.) 
e) Contract expiration –Information not held by DBTH. (Section 1(1)) 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - Information not held by DBTH. (Section 1(1)) 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - No 
h) Procurement framework –Information not held by DBTH, as the system is procured and managed by 
Sheffield Teaching Hospitals. (Section 1(1)) 
i) Other systems it integrates with? –DBTH does not hold full integration details. The system is hosted by 
Sheffield Teaching Hospitals and technical integration management sits with them. (Section 1(1)) 
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) –DBTH accesses ChemoCare through hosted arrangements 
with Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. System ownership, procurement, contract 
management and technical administration sit with STH. 
 
8. Patient Portal – A patient Portal is something that a patient logs into externally and can see details of their 
care etc. We don’t have one of these at this trust. 
a) System type –  
b) Supplier name – 
c) System name –  
d) Date installed – 
e) Contract expiration –  
f) Is this contract annually renewed? -  
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? -  
h) Procurement framework –  
i) Other systems it integrates with? – 
j) Total value of contract (£) – Commercially Sensitive 
We are applying Section 43(2), under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. This exempts disclosure  
of information which is prejudicial to commercial interests. If details of the annual amount paid to  
EMIS were disclosed into the public domain, this information would constitute a risk to the  
commercial interests of as the provision of such information may / could provide other suppliers of  
similar software with an unfair commercial advantage in any on-going and future NHS procurement  
exercises.  
It is important to appreciate that a disclosure to a request from a single applicant is not viewed in  
law as a disclosure to just that person, but a release of information into the public domain which  
when released cannot be reclaimed or rolled back. Hence, we feel that the risk is significant that  
release of such information would be likely to prejudice commercial interests of EMIS 
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k) Notes - e.g. we are currently out to tender 
 
 
9. Pharmacy 
System type – EPMA & Stock Control 
b) Supplier name – System C 
c) System name – Wellsky 
d) Date installed – Current version 21/10/2021 (in place at the trust since Dec 1999) 
e) Contract expiration – June 2026 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? – At present YES, but only due to the EPR project, normally 3 yearly 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? – Partially, the EPMA side of Wellsky will be replaced 
as part of the EPR project, the Stock control side will be retained and is not currently expected to be 
replaced. 
h) Procurement framework – EPR upgrade 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – Camis, Medisec, Clinical Portal, Yorkshire Humber Care Record, 
Pharmoutcomes, Pharmacy Robot(s), TIE, Powergate, Med E Checker and Pharmacy E-ordering 
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 
 
10. Transfers of care system 
) System type – PAS 
b) Supplier name – EMIS 
c) System name – CaMIS 
d) Date installed – 2015 
e) Contract expiration – 10/2026 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes, In scope to be replaced as part  
of the EPR replacement project  
h) Procurement framework – CDS 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – Nervecentre, Wellsky, Medisec, Symphony, ICE, Medical  
Imaging  
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 
 
11. Virtual Wards 
System type – Digital 
b) Supplier name – EMIS 
c) System name – CaMIS (Nervecentre and SystemOne) 
d) Date installed – 03/10/2023 
e) Contract expiration – 02/10/2026 
f) Is this contract annually renewed? - No 
g) Do you currently have plans to replace this system? - Yes, In scope to be replaced as part  
of the EPR replacement project  
h) Procurement framework – N/A 



Our Ref: 693 
November 2025 
 
i) Other systems it integrates with? – none 
j) Total value of contract (£) – Individual supplier costs are Commercially Sensitive under Section  
43(1). 
k) Notes (e.g. we are currently out to tender) – 
 
 
If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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