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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 
All questions relate to your audiology service. 
Workforce: 
1.      The following questions refer to qualified/registered audiologists in your department (please 
include audiologists and clinical scientists that provide audiological services): 
  
a)      How many audiologists do you have in headcount? 15 
b)      How many audiologists do you have in full time equivalents (FTE)? 12.1 
c)      How many FTE job vacancies do you have for qualified audiologists/registered audiologists? 4 
  
Services: 
2.      Which of the following services does your audiology department deliver for adults (please include 
all that apply)? 
X Hearing assessment 
X Hearing aid fitting 
X Follow up appointment 
X Aftercare – including but not limited to tubing, fine tuning etc. 
X Hearing reassessment 
☐Wax management 
X ENT support please state: Audiologists support ENT clinics 5 days per week 
☐Other, please state: Please enter text here. 
  
3.      What is the current wait time for patients to receive the first initial hearing assessment? 
  
Please enter the number of weeks here. Average wait is currently 16 weeks for new referrals (Oct 2025 data) 
  
4.      After a hearing assessment, what is the average wait time for a patient to have their hearing aid 
fitted?  
  
Please enter the number of weeks here. Average wait is currently 8 weeks (Oct 2025 data) 
  
5.      Once the hearing aid has been fitted, on average how long do patients have to wait for the first 
follow up appointment? 
  
Please enter the number of weeks here. Data not available as this is dependent on patient need so is a 
variable timescale 
  
6.      What proportion (%) of patients that are referred to adult audiology services for a hearing 
assessment are referred from either: 
a.      ENT: Please enter the percentage here. Not known – the Trust does not hold referrer information in 
a reportable format within the audiology data system. 
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b.      GP: Please enter the percentage here. the Trust does not hold referrer information in a reportable 
format within the audiology data system. 
c.      Self-referral: Please enter the percentage here. We do not receive self referrals 
d.      Other, please state: Please enter the percentage here. 
  
The audiology system does not routinely capture or store referrer source data in a way that allows this 
information to be extracted or reported. As such, the Trust is unable to provide the proportion of referrals 
originating from ENT or GP services. 
 
7.      What is the local bilateral fitting rate? (please state the percentage) 
Please enter the percentage here. Not known – the Trust does not hold this information in a reportable 
format. The audiology data system does not currently record bilateral fitting activity in a way that enables the 
calculation of a bilateral fitting rate. 
  
8.      Please list any adult audiological services that use patient initiated follow-up (PIFU)? 
 
Our Audiology service uses PIFU as part of follow up pathways 
  
  
9.      Do you offer private audiological services for adults? 
 
No 
  
10.  a. How many adult hearing assessments does your department perform in an average month?  
 
Oct 2025 data – 266 
 
b. And what proportion (%) of these assessments are new patients?  
 
 
Please enter the percentage here. Oct 2025 data – 266 in total – 175 new patients 66% 
 
  
11.  a. How many adults does your department fit with hearing aids in an average month?  
 
Oct 2025 data 223 fittings 
 
b. And what proportion (%) these fits are for new patients?  
  
Please enter the percentage here. Not known – the Trust does not hold this information in a reportable 
format. The audiology data system does not currently record whether a fitting relates to a new or existing 
patient in a way that allows this percentage to be calculated. 
  
12.  If audiologists in your department provides aural care, please state how many patients are treated for 
ear wax in an average month? 
 Not applicable  
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13.  What is the average wait time for access to an appointment for earwax management? 
  
Please enter the number of weeks here. Not Applicable 
 
 
If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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