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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would like to request the following information: 
 
Please note, that my questions are in relation to fellowships in Trauma 
and Orthopaedics only. 
 
1. Do you currently offer, or have you offered in the last year any post CCT (or equivalent) 
fellowships in trauma and orthopaedics (or subspecialties thereof)? 
 
Not directly.  DBTH is part of a scheme which receives doctors for fixed periods to support 
their training in different areas of trauma and orthopaedics but does not run the scheme.  This 
is similar to, but different from the HEE national training posts. 
 
2. For each fellowship that you offer, please could you answer/provide 
the following: 
 
       a. What is the sub-speciality?  
Varies dependent on the requirements of the doctor 
 
       b. What was the advertised base pay (or nodal point e.g. MT04, MT05) that the job offers? 
Unknown the Trust does not advertise these posts 
 
       c. Does the fellowship include being part of an on-call rota, or attract any uplift from the 
base pay? 
Yes, the doctors participate in the on-call rota, for which they are remunerated. 
 
       d. Is that inclusion on the on-call rota optional? 
No 
 
       e. If yes to question c, please include a copy of the rota, and associated uplift in pay? 
 

Week Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat Sun 

1 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

2 8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00  8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00 8:00 - 24:00 

3 00:00 - 9:00  8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

4 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

5 8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

6 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00  8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00 

7  8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

8 8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   
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9 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

10 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 12:30 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 

11   8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

12 8:00 - 24:00 00:00 - 9:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00 8:00 - 18:00   

 
 
Doctors who participate in the on-call rota are remunerated for this work in accordance with 
the applicable national Terms and Conditions of Service (including any on-call availability and 
out-of-hours payments), based on their contractual arrangements and the on-call commitments 
required of the role. 
The Trust does not hold a single, fixed “uplift” amount for these posts that can be disclosed in 
isolation. The value of any on-call-related payment is determined by a combination of factors, 
which may include (for example) the individual’s contractual pay point, the frequency and 
category of on-call commitment, and the nature and timing of work undertaken. As a result, 
providing the “associated uplift” as a single figure would either require the Trust to create a 
calculation which it does not hold as recorded information, or would involve disclosing 
individual-level pay information, which would constitute personal data. 
However, to assist, the Trust can confirm that on-call remuneration is paid in line with national 
arrangements, rather than a locally set or supplier-specific rate, and that doctors participating in 
the rota are remunerated accordingly. 
 
       f. How many annual leave days does this fellowship allow? 
27 days or 32 days dependent upon NHS service 
 
       g. How many study leave days does this fellowship allow? 
10 days per annum 
 
       h. What is the study leave budget for the fellowship? 
There is no specific budget this depends on the requirements of the doctor at their stage of 
training. 
 
       i. Please include a copy of the job description and person specification for the job 
DBTH do not advertise this post so there is no JD or PS available to include. 
 
 

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 
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Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
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