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Freedom of Information Act Request 
 
 
I am writing to request the following information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
 
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (DBTH) does not provide cardiac 
catheterisation laboratory services or cardiac surgery services, including heart valve repair or replacement 
procedures (such as TAVI, TEER, sAVR or Bentall procedures). Highly specialised cardiac services are 
commissioned regionally and delivered by tertiary cardiac centres, primarily Sheffield Teaching Hospitals 
NHS Foundation Trust.. 
As a result, DBTH does not hold recorded information relating to the facilities, procedures, utilisation, or 
workforce described in your request.  
 
 
1. Regarding cardiac catheterisation laboratories and their utilization 
 
Site One 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
Contains a Cath Lab (Yes/No)  
 
Performs catheter-based valve replacements (Yes/No)  
 
Number of days per week are catheter-based valve interventions within the cath lab  
 
 
 
Site Two 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
Contains a Cath Lab (Yes/No)  
 
Performs catheter-based valve replacements (Yes/No)  
 
Number of days per week are catheter-based valve interventions within the cath lab  
 
 
 
Site Three 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
Contains a Cath Lab (Yes/No)  
 
Performs catheter-based valve replacements (Yes/No)  
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Number of days per week are catheter-based valve interventions within the cath lab  
 
 
 
 
 
Any additional data you hold regarding utilisation of these facilities (e.g. number of sessions scheduled per 
week, or average percentage utilisation). 
 
   
 
 
 
 
 
2. Regarding theatres used for cardiac surgery 
 
Site One 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
The number of theatres currently in operation: 
 
The number of theatres used for Cardiac surgery: 
 
   
 
 Site Two 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
The number of theatres currently in operation:  
 
The number of theatres used for Cardiac surgery: 
 
 
 
Site Three 
 
Site at which located e.g. hospital name: 
 
The number of theatres currently in operation:  
 
The number of theatres used for Cardiac surgery: 
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3. Regarding procedures 
 
a. What is the total number of heart valve repair or replacement procedures (e.g. TAVI or TEER) performed in 
cardiac Catheterisation laboratories during the most recent full financial or calendar year for which you 
hold data.  
 
b. What is the total number of heart valve repair or replacement procedures e.g. (sAVR or Bentall 
procedures) performed in cardiac theatres during the same period. 
 
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (DBTH) does not provide cardiac 
catheterisation laboratory services or cardiac surgery services, including heart valve repair or replacement 
procedures such as TAVI, TEER, sAVR or Bentall procedures. 
Highly specialised cardiac services are commissioned regionally and delivered by tertiary cardiac centres, 
primarily Sheffield Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust. 
As a result, DBTH does not hold recorded information relating to the facilities, procedures, activity levels, 
utilisation, or workforce described in this question. 
Under section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, public authorities are only required to provide 
information that they hold. The Trust therefore does not hold the information requested for parts (a) or (b). 
 
 
4. Regarding workforce and future planning 
 
a. What is the number of officially approved headcounts for the cardiology and cardiac surgery 
departments. 
 
The Trust can confirm that there are 179 employees recorded within the Cardiology department. 
However, due to the way staffing information is held on our systems and the structure of the Trust’s 
organisational hierarchy, we are not able to separately identify or confirm an approved headcount 
specifically for Cardiac Surgery. Cardiac Surgery staff are not recorded as a distinct standalone department 
within our workforce systems, and therefore this information is not held in a reportable format. 
Under section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, public authorities are only required to provide 
information that they hold. The Trust does not hold the requested headcount data for Cardiac Surgery in the 
format requested. 
 
 
b. Are there any plans for investment over the next three years in: 
 
  - Structural developments (e.g. new cath labs or theatres) 
 
- Personnel (e.g. healthcare professionals, nurses, or support staff) 
 
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust cannot report on future investment 
plans, as these are subject to ongoing development, approval, and change through internal governance 
processes and wider NHS commissioning and funding decisions. At the time of your request, there are no 
confirmed, finalised, or approved plans that could be reported in a definitive or reliable manner. 
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Under section 1(1) of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, public authorities are only required to provide 
information that they hold at the time of the request. As the Trust does not hold settled or confirmed 
information regarding future structural or workforce investment plans in the format requested, this 
information is not held for the purposes of the Act. 
 
 
c. How does your organisation define its catchment area and the estimated size of the population served. 
Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust (Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching 
Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust) does not operate a single, fixed “catchment area” in the strict sense. 
Instead, the population served varies depending on the specific service being provided and the 
commissioning arrangements in place. 
In general terms, DBTH provides acute hospital services primarily to the populations of: 

• Doncaster 
• Bassetlaw (North Nottinghamshire) 

Based on local commissioning and population estimates, this equates to an approximate resident 
population of around 440,000–450,000 people. 
However, some services provided by DBTH may serve wider or more specialised populations, while other 
highly specialised services (such as tertiary cardiac surgery) are commissioned regionally and delivered by 
specialist centres outside DBTH. As a result, population figures may vary by service and are not held as a 
single definitive catchment figure. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request 

an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40 

working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to 

d.wraith@nhs.net. 

 

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the 

Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at: 

 

Information Commissioner's Office 

Wycliffe House 

Water Lane 

Wilmslow 

Cheshire 

SK9 5AF 

Tel: 0303 123 1113 

Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
 

https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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