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Freedom of Information Act Request

1. Any current policies, protocols, guidelines, criteria or written procedures that permit
serving or former members of HM Armed Forces (veterans) to be given priority or to be
fast-tracked for ultrasound scans (or diagnostic imaging in general) ahead of other
patients with the same clinical urgency rating.

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust supports the
principles of the Armed Forces Covenant. In line with national NHS guidance, the Trust
recognises that priority treatment may be appropriate where a patient’s injury or illness is
directly attributable to their military service.

Any such consideration is always determined by clinical need. This does not permit
veterans to be prioritised ahead of other patients with the same or greater clinical
urgency, nor does it override established clinical prioritisation frameworks.

Diagnostic imaging, including ultrasound scans, is scheduled according to standard
clinical urgency criteria that apply equally to all patients. Veteran status alone does not
confer automatic priority, fast-tracking, or preferential access to ultrasound or other
diagnostic imaging services. The Trust does not operate separate waiting lists or
prioritisation pathways based solely on veteran status.

2. If such a policy or arrangement exists, please provide:

- A copy of the document (or a link to it if published)

- The date it was introduced or last updated

- The clinical pathways or specialties it applies to

- Whether it applies to all types of ultrasound or only specific examinations

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust does not hold a specific
policy, protocol, guideline or written arrangement that permits serving or former members
of HM Armed Forces (veterans) to be prioritised or fast-tracked for ultrasound scans, or
diagnostic imaging more generally, ahead of other patients with the same clinical urgency
solely on the basis of veteran status.

As no such policy or arrangement exists within the Trust, there is:

¢ No document to provide or link to,

e Nointroduction or review date,

¢ No specific clinical pathways or specialties to which it applies, and

¢ No application to any type of ultrasound examination.

All ultrasound and diagnostic imaging requests are prioritised in accordance with
established clinical urgency criteria that apply equally to all patients.
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3. For the period 1 January 2025 to 12 December 2025, please state:
- How many patients identified as veterans were prioritised or expedited for an ultrasound
scan specifically because of their veteran status

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust is unable to provide this
information because it does not hold recorded data identifying patients who were
prioritised or expedited for ultrasound scans on the basis of veteran status.

The Trust does not prioritise diagnostic imaging requests, including ultrasound scans, based
on veteran status. All imaging referrals are scheduled according to clinical urgency and
clinical need, in line with established clinical prioritisation frameworks that apply equally to
all patients.

As veteran status is not used as a criterion in imaging prioritisation decisions, it is not
recorded within diagnostic imaging systems as a reason for prioritisation. Consequently, the
Trust does not hold information that would enable it to identify or quantify patients who
were prioritised specifically because they were veterans.

Under section 1 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000, the Trust is required to provide
recorded information it holds and is not required to create new information in order to
respond to a request.

- How the Trust records and verifies veteran status when a priority decision is made

Doncaster and Bassetlaw Teaching Hospitals NHS Foundation Trust does not make diagnostic imaging
prioritisation decisions, including for ultrasound scans, on the basis of veteran status.

Where veteran status is recorded, this is typically captured through patient self-identification at the point of
registration or during clinical assessment, in line with national NHS guidance. This information may be
recorded within patient administrative or clinical systems for the purposes of support, signposting or
equality monitoring, including alignment with the Armed Forces Covenant.

Veteran status is not used as a standalone criterion to determine clinical priority for diagnostic imaging. As
such, the Trust does not operate a separate verification process for veteran status in relation to
prioritisation decisions, and there is no requirement to verify veteran status when determining access to
ultrasound or other diagnostic imaging services.

All prioritisation decisions are based on clinical urgency and clinical need, regardless of veteran status.

If you are not satisfied with the handling of your request, you have the right to request
an internal review. Requests for an internal review should be submitted within 40
working days from the date of this response, and should be addressed to
d.wraith@nhs.net.

If you remain dissatisfied after the internal review, you have the right to appeal to the
Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO). The ICO can be contacted at:

Information Commissioner's Office
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Website: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/
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